
RACE  1	 12:05 PM	 (A$21,000)	 Townsville	 --   1000m
1	 162590	 Circularity	 60.5	 [	 4]	 J Huxtable	 15.8%	 L J Hatch	 18.3%
2	 336041	 All Time Legend	 60	 [	 2]	 R Wiggins	 20.4%	 S Massingham	 20.6%
3	 423153	 Missile Thunder	 59	 [	 5]	 T Leslight (3)	 11.7%	 O Chillemi	 14.6%
4	 113506	 Invincible Jet	 54	 [	 8]	 Ms C Jokic	 7.5%	 J Manzelmann	 7.9%
5	 112862	 Crowning Moment	 54	 [	 7]	 --	 --%	 O Chillemi	 14.6%
6	 048257	 Mister Larrabee	 54	 [	 9]	 N Thomas	 5.4%	 J Manzelmann	 7.9%
7	 367241	 Red Boomshakalaka	 54	 [	 1]	 J Taylor	 7.1%	 B Williams	 11.7%
8	 611977	 Kiss Me Later	 54	 [	 3]	 A Sewell	 7.6%	 B Williams	 11.7%
9	 211490	 Rough Cut Jewel	 54	 [	 6]	 Ms L Morrison	 23.7%	 A R Bailey	 14.3%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 TOWNSVILLE 	 1000M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1000M
	 2	 All Time Legend
	 3	 Missile Thunder
	 7	 Red Boomshakalaka
	 4	 Invincible Jet

7	 Red Boomshakalaka	 61%
3	 Missile Thunder	 50%
5	 Crowning Moment	 41%
9	 Rough Cut Jewel	 33%
2	 All Time Legend	 27%

7	 Red Boomshakalaka	 54%
3	 Missile Thunder	 42%
6	 Mister Larrabee	 40%
2	 All Time Legend	 38%
1	 Circularity	 36%

2	 All Time Legend	 0:55.26
7	 Red Boomshakalaka	0:55.36
3	 Missile Thunder	 0:55.83
1	 Circularity	 0:55.95
4	 Invincible Jet	 0:56.21

Race Preview: All Time Legend Freshened. Put paid to them easily at Cairns at latest. Decent 
alley. One of the major players. Missile Thunder Better effort at Atherton last outing. Claim helps. 
Likes racing here. Strong claims. Red Boomshakalaka Led and just lasted at Ewan at latest. Nicely 
weighted. Has had success around this circuit. Drawn favourably. Respect. Invincible Jet Returning 
from let-up. Well beaten at Dingo last time. Prefer others. Circularity Returning from let-up. On the 
speed but ran out of petrol quickly here at latest. Likely to find this easier. Improved showing on the 
cards.

RACE  2	 12:20 PM	 (A$29,000)	 Cootamundra	 --   1100m
1	 844106	 Off Shaw	 64.5	 [	 5]	 R B Prag (2)	 7.7%	 J Rolfe	 5.3%
2	 713977	 Free State	 62.5	 [	 4]	 Glenn Cahill (3)	 6.7%	 Ms S M-Leslie	 6.3%
3	 326726	 Sussu	 61	 [	 6]	 O A Dalton (3)	 12.2%	 Joseph Ible	 9.9%
4	 1753	 Flycatcher	 59.5	 [	 7]	 J Duffy	 8.9%	 C Weeding	 12.5%
5	 746371	 Hurricane Thunder	 58	 [	10]	 N Souquet	 14.5%	 Mitchell Beer	 13.0%
6	 355793	 Puerto Rico	 57.5	 [	 8]	 Ms C Keatings (1.5)	 12.6%	 M Kelley	 12.1%
7	 575244	 Mooshaka	 57	 [	 3]	 B Owen	 17.0%	 N Olive	 16.6%
8	 867048	 Into The Fire	 56	 [	 9]	 M A Cahill	 11.2%	 G G Kirkup	 10.5%
9	 213	 Miss Mikki Isle	 55	 [	 2]	 J Richards	 6.6%	 Darrell Burnet	 17.2%
10	673887	 Just One Look	 55	 [	 1]	 Ms E Hennessy	 6.4%	 J D Cooper	 4.3%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 COOTAMUNDRA 	 1100M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1100M
	 9	 Miss Mikki Isle
	 6	 Puerto Rico
	 3	 Sussu
	 4	 Flycatcher

4	 Flycatcher	 100%
2	 Free State	 83%
8	 Into The Fire	 61%
3	 Sussu	 50%
5	 Hurricane Thunder	 33%

6	 Puerto Rico	 1:03.38
3	 Sussu	 1:03.59
8	 Into The Fire	 1:03.66
7	 Mooshaka	 1:04.10
2	 Free State	 1:04.62

Race Preview: Miss Mikki Isle No match for winner but kept on for the minor spoils at Wagga last 
start. On pacer. Favourably drawn. Sure to have plenty of admirers. Puerto Rico Improved showing 
at Nowra last time out. 1.5kg claimer engaged. Tough alley. Not out of this. Sussu Returning from 
let-up. 3kg claimer engaged. In the mix. Flycatcher Improved showing at Leeton first-up. Fitter. Not 
out of this. Hurricane Thunder Back from a let-up. Powered home from back half to get the money at 
Nowra last start. Worth some thought.

RACE  3	 12:45 PM	 (A$21,000)	 Townsville	 --   1609m
1	 765542	 Diasonic	 64	 [	12]	 --	 --%	 L Manzelmann	 10.7%
2	 376317	 Vancouver Bay	 64	 [	13]	 Zac Sprie (3)	 5.8%	 S J Royes	 12.9%
3	 084437	 Going Nuclear	 61	 [	 6]	 R Wiggins	 20.4%	 M McGuire	 11.9%
4	 540305	 The Real Thing	 61	 [	 9]	 P Romeo	 4.2%	 A M Comerford	 23.3%
5	 975511	 Tycoon Lad	 61	 [	 8]	 Ms A Butler	 19.7%	 Ms G Bourke	 19.4%
6	 605486	 Strathcona	 58.5	 [	10]	 C Whiteley	 8.3%	 Megan Purvis	 0.0%
7	 067814	 Gigi Fille	 57	 [	 1]	 S Sheargold	 9.8%	 Thomas Parker	 25.0%
8	 320085	 Brand New	 56.5	 [	 7]	 Ms L Morrison	 23.7%	 T & P Rowe	 8.9%
9	 716386	 Patti Waggin	 56.5	 [	 5]	 J Huxtable	 15.8%	 J Manzelmann	 7.9%
10	880409	 Fergyliscious	 56	 [	 3]	 N Thomas	 5.4%	 Ms L McCormack	 2.5%
11	614307	 Vee Eight Power	 56	 [	11]	 J Taylor	 7.1%	 B Williams	 11.7%
12	952145	 Miss Shalaa	 54.5	 [	 4]	 M Potgieter	 8.0%	 W E Winters	 5.9%
13	878774	 Pluckercarn	 55	 [	 2]	 Ms C Jokic	 7.5%	 Troy Clive	 2.8%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 TOWNSVILLE 	 1609M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1609M
	 7	 Gigi Fille
	 5	 Tycoon Lad
	 2	 Vancouver Bay
	 13	Pluckercarn

2	 Vancouver Bay	 38%
13	Pluckercarn	 22%
6	 Strathcona	 17%
11	Vee Eight Power	 14%
12	Miss Shalaa	 11%

7	 Gigi Fille	 50%
8	 Brand New	 40%
2	 Vancouver Bay	 29%
13	Pluckercarn	 24%
1	 Diasonic	 22%

13	Pluckercarn	 1:36.32
2	 Vancouver Bay	 1:36.65

Race Preview: Gigi Fille Gave a good sight at Mackay last outing. Among the dangers. Tycoon Lad 
Shooting for hat-trick. Set tempo and raced clear for a dominant victory under 62.5kg at Ewan last 
time out. Include among the better chances. Vancouver Bay Freshened. On the speed but ran out of 
petrol quickly at Cairns last start. Had solid form before that. Worth another chance. Pluckercarn Re-
turning from let-up. Fair effort without threatening in the wet at Rockhampton last time out. Generally 
gets back in races. Has performed well on this track. Consider. Miss Shalaa Went to line only fairly at 
Bowen last time out. Has the job ahead.

RACE  4	 1:05 PM	 (A$25,000)	 Northam	 --   1600m
1	 809484	 Think Lika Winner	 57	 [	 2]	 W Pike	 25.2%	 E Martinovich	 7.4%
2	 30466	 Ah Kum	 57	 [	 7]	 C Parnham	 18.6%	 Ms S Miller	 8.3%
3	 73	 Neap Tide	 57	 [	 6]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 A Durrant	 13.4%
4	 0	 Bad Company	 57	 [	 1]	 J Noske	 9.1%	 M Pateman	 11.1%
5	 540523	 Smart Shadow	 55	 [	 4]	 Ms V Corver	 7.4%	 Ryan Hill	 7.8%
6	 888550	 Classic Impact	 55	 [	 5]	 B B-Edwards	 6.7%	 M Santich	 2.4%
7	 59	 Kunapipi	 55	 [	 3]	 Ms L Staples	 6.4%	 P Jordan	 3.2%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1600M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1600M
	 3	 Neap Tide
	 2	 Ah Kum
	 5	 Smart Shadow
	 1	 Think Lika Winner

6	 Classic Impact	 1:39.93

Race Preview: Neap Tide On a quick back-up. Promising 3yo. Settled handy and battled on soundly 
to fill the minors last outing. One of the major players. Ah Kum Promising 3yo. Battled on fairly at 
Belmont Park at latest. Ready for this trip now. Back to provincial level. Major player. Smart Shadow 
On a quick back-up. On pace but outgunned late at Bunbury at latest. Leads/handy. Ready for this 
trip now. Nice gate. Each-way. Think Lika Winner Gave a good sight at Belmont Park last start. Up 
in distance now. Drawn well. Back to provincial level. Among the dangers. Classic Impact Lacked a 
pick-up and only plugged to line at Belmont Park last outing. Back to provincial level. Each-way.

RACE  5	 1:20 PM	 (A$21,000)	 Townsville	 --   1200m
1	 460533	 Investor	 60	 [	 1]	 M Murphy	 12.5%	 T & P Rowe	 8.9%
2	 220021	 Spirit Meister	 60	 [	 5]	 Nathan Day	 18.8%	 R J Miller	 13.6%
3	 021111	 Hellish	 58.5	 [	 6]	 J P Stanley	 18.1%	 C Taylor	 26.4%
4	 232400	 Realeza	 58.5	 [	 9]	 Ms A Butler	 19.7%	 S J Royes	 12.9%
5	 526365	 Tycoon Beau	 58.5	 [	 3]	 R Wiggins	 20.4%	 S Massingham	 20.6%
6	 880851	 Overlord	 57	 [	 4]	 Ms L Morrison	 23.7%	 A R Bailey	 14.3%
7	 686559	 Principessa	 56.5	 [	 7]	 T Leslight (3)	 11.7%	 A R Bailey	 14.3%
8	 309100	 Brave Agenda	 53.5	 [	 2]	 A Sewell	 7.6%	 R Kirkwood	 10.0%
9	 752339	 Martini Moment	 53.5	 [	 8]	 Ms C Jokic	 7.5%	 J Manzelmann	 7.9%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 TOWNSVILLE 	 1200M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1200M
	 3	 Hellish
	 6	 Overlord
	 7	 Principessa
	 1	 Investor

5	 Tycoon Beau	 67%
4	 Realeza	 27%
1	 Investor	 25%
2	 Spirit Meister	 10%

5	 Tycoon Beau	 47%
3	 Hellish	 42%
7	 Principessa	 39%
4	 Realeza	 33%
6	 Overlord	 33%

2	 Spirit Meister	 1:08.63
5	 Tycoon Beau	 1:09.55
3	 Hellish	 1:09.89
4	 Realeza	 1:09.95
6	 Overlord	 1:09.96

Race Preview: Hellish Chasing fifth successive win. Makes his own luck. One of the major players. 
Overlord Freshened. Timed run to perfection to score at Cairns first-up. Drawn to receive every 
chance. Major player. Principessa Freshened. Was safely held at Cairns at latest. Not out of this. In-
vestor Freshened. Kept finding the line at Cairns last outing. Drawn favourably. Worth some thought. 
Tycoon Beau Freshened. Worked home okay to finish close to placegetters last time out. Nice gate. 
Keep in mind.
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RACE  6	 1:40 PM	 (A$30,000)	 Northam	 --   1600m
1	 415644	 Audio Boy	 60	 [	 7]	 C J’ston-Porter	 16.0%	 A Durrant	 13.4%
2	 428234	 Miro	 60	 [	 4]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 A Durrant	 13.4%
3	 646377	 Be Awesome	 59	 [	 3]	 C Cooper (3)	 10.5%	 G & A Williams	 20.0%
4	 046332	 Ayumi	 58.5	 [	 2]	 Amy Jo Hayes (3)	 0.0%	 T Andrews	 8.8%
5	 425346	 More Special	 58.5	 [	 6]	 C Martinan (3)	 5.2%	 P Jordan	 3.2%
6	 413867	 The Rooster	 58	 [	 5]	 S O’Donnell	 4.8%	 Ms J Erkelens	 11.1%
7	 003897	 Cherokee Miss	 57.5	 [	 1]	 Ms N Faithfull	 14.0%	 Matthew Scott	 4.0%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1600M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1600M
	 1	 Audio Boy
	 2	 Miro
	 5	 More Special
	 4	 Ayumi

3	 Be Awesome	 100%
4	 Ayumi	 33%
5	 More Special	 17%

6	 The Rooster	 67%
3	 Be Awesome	 33%
7	 Cherokee Miss	 33%
5	 More Special	 17%

5	 More Special	 1:37.54
4	 Ayumi	 1:37.71
3	 Be Awesome	 1:38.52
6	 The Rooster	 1:38.83
2	 Miro	 1:39.87

Race Preview: Audio Boy Ready to win. Just behind the placegetters at Belmont Park at latest. Back 
to provincial level. Commands respect. Miro Form sound. Wasn’t all that far away at Bunbury last 
outing. Drawn well. Can play a key role. More Special Wasn’t all that far away at Belmont Park last 
outing. 3kg claimer engaged. Back to provincial level. Among the main chances. Ayumi On a quick 
back-up. Ran on well to place at Bunbury last time out. 3kg claimer engaged. Drawn well. Knockout 
chance. Be Awesome 3kg claimer engaged. Back to provincial level. Knockout chance.

RACE  7	 1:55 PM	 (A$21,000)	 Townsville	 --   1200m
1	 492262	 Specialtie	 61.5	 [	 6]	 Ms A Butler	 19.7%	 Ms G Bourke	 19.4%
2	 183868	 Triggerific	 61.5	 [	 9]	 Ms C Jokic	 7.5%	 Ms C Jokic	 9.1%
3	 414065	 My Artie	 61	 [	13]	 Ms L Morrison	 23.7%	 A R Bailey	 14.3%
4	 674635	 Five Bulls	 60.5	 [	 3]	 J Taylor	 7.1%	 Ms J Ryan	 10.1%
5	 763462	 Harvesta	 60.5	 [	12]	 M Potgieter	 8.0%	 W E Winters	 5.9%
6	 527260	 Mirror Illusion	 59	 [	 5]	 M Murphy	 12.5%	 T & P Rowe	 8.9%
7	 348034	 No Love Lost	 59	 [	 8]	 --	 --%	 B Thomson	 3.1%
8	 229453	 Euromantic	 58.5	 [	 1]	 T Leslight (3)	 11.7%	 S J Royes	 12.9%
9	 204728	 Hit Snooze	 58.5	 [	11]	 J Huxtable	 15.8%	 Ms G Bourke	 19.4%
10	278401	 Winning Saga	 57.5	 [	14]	 Nathan Day	 18.8%	 B Williams	 11.7%
11	464703	 Dickin Medal	 57	 [	 4]	 --	 --%	 G R Hughes	 8.3%
12	721808	 Jazz Worthy	 56	 [	 7]	 A Sewell	 7.6%	 R Kirkwood	 10.0%
13	567634	 Midnight Boom	 55	 [	10]	 C Whiteley	 8.3%	 Megan Purvis	 0.0%
14	105995	 Sheez Marvellous	 54.5	 [	 2]	 P Romeo	 4.2%	 A Molino	 8.2%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 TOWNSVILLE 	 1200M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1200M
	 2	 Triggerific
	 1	 Specialtie
	 4	 Five Bulls
	 14	Sheez Marvellous

1	 Specialtie	 39%
12	Jazz Worthy	 38%
4	 Five Bulls	 37%
3	 My Artie	 33%
10	Winning Saga	 23%

5	 Harvesta	 42%
12	Jazz Worthy	 42%
13	Midnight Boom	 39%
9	 Hit Snooze	 34%
3	 My Artie	 33%

9	 Hit Snooze	 1:08.27
11	Dickin Medal	 1:09.39
7	 No Love Lost	 1:09.43
10	Winning Saga	 1:09.96
5	 Harvesta	 1:10.11

Race Preview: Triggerific First-up. Previously trained by Ms L Tolson & Ms L Proctor. Placed at 
Cranbourne last time in. Respect. Specialtie Resuming. Wasn’t far away in Maiden company at 
Gold Coast Poly first-up last campaign. Can measure up fresh. Five Bulls Freshened. Ran home 
respectably at Cairns last outing. Drawn favourably. Among the dangers. Sheez Marvellous Far from 
disgraced at Ewan last start. Won’t be far away in the run. Ready for this trip now. Drawn to effect. 
Each-way. My Artie Freshened. Wasn’t all that far away at Cairns last outing. In the mix.

RACE  8	 2:15 PM	 (A$25,000)	 Northam	 --   1600m
1	 323628	 Knentii	 58	 [	13]	 W Pike	 25.2%	 D M Luciani	 9.0%
2	 225780	 Coventry Reef	 58	 [	11]	 J Azzopardi	 6.5%	 Ms R Nairn	 0.0%
3	 550002	 No Bid	 58	 [	 5]	 S Parnham	 8.1%	 R Radford	 8.6%
4	 07648	 Choice Thinking	 58	 [	 9]	 J Noske	 9.1%	 T Andrews	 8.8%
5	 605	 Uni Strike	 58	 [	 2]	 S O’Donnell	 4.8%	 Ms J Erkelens	 11.1%
6	 98	 Obscentino	 58	 [	12]	 J Turner	 7.0%	 B Graham	 3.8%
7	 740067	 On Guard M’lady	 56	 [	10]	 L Ramoly	 10.9%	 Ms K Kersley	 7.1%
8	 000096	 Zultanite	 56	 [	 3]	 K Dhurun	 5.8%	 Ms V Chalmers	 0.0%
9	 96036	 Sky God	 56	 [	 6]	 C J’ston-Porter	 16.0%	 Ms S Miller	 8.3%
10	885700	 Secret Girl	 56	 [	 1]	 Ms N Faithfull	 14.0%	 Matthew Scott	 4.0%
11	 0996	 Bling Beach	 56	 [	 4]	 H Watson	 7.7%	 M Pateman	 11.1%
12	 07	 Royal Trooper	 56	 [	 8]	 C Parnham	 18.6%	 D & B Pearce	 15.7%
13	 3	 Sweet Eyes	 54	 [	 7]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 A Durrant	 13.4%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1600M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1600M
	 2	 Coventry Reef
	 3	 No Bid
	 5	 Uni Strike
	 13	Sweet Eyes

3	 No Bid	 22%
2	 Coventry Reef	 17%

3	 No Bid	 33%
2	 Coventry Reef	 27%

3	 No Bid	 1:37.23
2	 Coventry Reef	 1:37.66
8	 Zultanite	 1:38.52
7	 On Guard M’lady	 1:39.02
1	 Knentii	 1:41.05

Race Preview: Coventry Reef Went to line only fairly at Bunbury last time out. Wide alley is a con-
cern. In the mix. No Bid Improved showing here at latest. Looks one of the main chances. Uni Strike 
Just battled home at Belmont Park first-up. Strips fitter. Decent alley. Back to provincial level. In the 
mix. Sweet Eyes Freshened. Handy and boxed on fairly to fill the minors at Bunbury on debut. In the 
mix. Royal Trooper Fair effort without threatening at Belmont Park last time out. Back to provincial 
level. In the mix.

RACE  9	 2:35 PM	 (A$21,000)	 Townsville	 --   1400m
1	 117400	 Sealion	 59	 [	11]	 Ms A Butler	 19.7%	 Ms J Ryan	 10.1%
2	 416660	 Brave Maso	 58.5	 [	 3]	 Zac Sprie (3)	 5.8%	 J P Caught	 8.1%
3	 208794	 Frostin’	 58.5	 [	 5]	 Ms T Chambers	 9.4%	 T Chambers	 7.7%
4	 332523	 Sir Maximus	 57.5	 [	12]	 C Whiteley	 8.3%	 M McGuire	 11.9%
5	 302871	 Private Cheetah	 57	 [	 1]	 J Huxtable	 15.8%	 D K Amos	 14.6%
6	 643343	 Valenki	 56.5	 [	10]	 Ms L Morrison	 23.7%	 O Chillemi	 14.6%
7	 582447	 Elleves	 56	 [	 4]	 M Murphy	 12.5%	 Troy Clive	 2.8%
8	 907363	 You Are King	 56	 [	 8]	 A Sewell	 7.6%	 B Williams	 11.7%
9	 099535	 The Sherpa	 54.5	 [	 6]	 M Potgieter	 8.0%	 A Molino	 8.2%
10	605486	 Strathcona	 54	 [	 2]	 J Taylor	 7.1%	 Megan Purvis	 0.0%
11	615092	 Dawn Strike	 54	 [	 9]	 P Romeo	 4.2%	 Ms J Hassett	 5.2%
12	927364	 Line Of Kings	 54	 [	 7]	 N Thomas	 5.4%	 R Henderson	 0.0%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 TOWNSVILLE 	 1400M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1400M
	 5	 Private Cheetah
	 3	 Frostin’
	 11	Dawn Strike
	 6	 Valenki

4	 Sir Maximus	 38%
1	 Sealion	 29%
11	Dawn Strike	 25%
9	 The Sherpa	 17%
10	Strathcona	 17%

4	 Sir Maximus	 61%
1	 Sealion	 38%
3	 Frostin’	 33%
2	 Brave Maso	 31%
8	 You Are King	 28%

1	 Sealion	 1:22.11
4	 Sir Maximus	 1:22.21
7	 Elleves	 1:22.27
2	 Brave Maso	 1:22.46
6	 Valenki	 1:22.47

Race Preview: Private Cheetah Narrowly prevailed at Mackay last start. Can go on with the job now 
he’s rediscovered winning form. Frostin’ Far from disgraced at Yeppoon last start. Ready for this trip 
now. Take beating. Dawn Strike Better effort at Ewan at latest. Key player. Valenki Ready to win. 
Finished off strongly at Atherton last start. Can play a key role. Sir Maximus Made the running but 
had no answer to challengers at Ewan last outing. Proven performer over this trip. Consider.

RACE 10	 2:50 PM	 (A$25,000)	 Northam	 --   1000m
1	 022589	 Pilbara Song	 58	 [	12]	 K Dhurun	 5.8%	 S J Ryan	 8.7%
2	 578538	 Rise To Glory	 56	 [	11]	 H Watson	 7.7%	 Sue Olive	 6.7%
3	 664632	 Dubai’s Daughter	 56	 [	 7]	 J Noske	 9.1%	 T Andrews	 8.8%
4	 43	 Red Autumn	 56	 [	13]	 W Pike	 25.2%	 D M Luciani	 9.0%
5	 5936	 Sansanee	 56	 [	 8]	 B B-Edwards	 6.7%	 B Pope	 8.7%
6	 7	 Sesh	 56	 [	10]	 J Turner	 7.0%	 R Radford	 8.6%
7	 8	 Bronze Rocket	 56	 [	 4]	 Ms V Corver	 7.4%	 Ryan Hill	 7.8%
8	 	 Gimme The Loot	 56	 [	 9]	 C J’ston-Porter	 16.0%	 Brandon Fiore	 8.9%
9	 4	 Cashel Palace	 54	 [	 5]	 L Campbell	 9.7%	 D Morton	 15.0%
10	 	 Fly Away Flirt	 54	 [	 2]	 C Martinan (3)	 5.2%	 Ryan Hill	 7.8%
11	 	 Haida Gwaii	 54	 [	 1]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 M Lane	 18.4%
12	 	 Magnique	 54	 [	 6]	 Ms N Faithfull	 14.0%	 Simon Miller	 14.8%
13	 00	 Playful Star	 54	 [	 3]	 L Ramoly	 10.9%	 N Parnham	 9.6%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1000M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1000M
	 4	 Red Autumn
	 11	Haida Gwaii
	 3	 Dubai’s Daughter
	 9	 Cashel Palace

3	 Dubai’s Daughter	 67%
1	 Pilbara Song	 33%
5	 Sansanee	 33%

4	 Red Autumn	 33%
3	 Dubai’s Daughter	 25%
1	 Pilbara Song	 10%

3	 Dubai’s Daughter	 0:58.09
5	 Sansanee	 0:58.40
1	 Pilbara Song	 0:58.54
4	 Red Autumn	 0:58.70
2	 Rise To Glory	 0:59.23

Race Preview: Red Autumn Knocking on the door. Let down well from back of the pack to place 
at Belmont Park last time out. Back to provincial level. Take beating. Haida Gwaii Trials: (4:1-2-1). 
Looked good at the trials. Watch the market. Dubai’s Daughter Solid on-pace performance here last 
outing. Each-way. Cashel Palace First-up. Back to provincial level. Each-way. Magnique Trials: (3:1-
1-0). Indicated talent at the trials. Monitor betting moves.
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RACE 11	 3:21 PM	 (A$25,000)	 Northam	 --   1300m
1	 89092	 Star Prophet	 58	 [	 4]	 J Turner	 7.0%	 C Webster	 6.3%
2	 90	 Noble Reign	 58	 [	 9]	 A Galati	 12.7%	 Ms E Strempel	 8.3%
3	 7	 Kamikaze Fighter	 58	 [	 1]	 J Azzopardi	 6.5%	 J Humphries	 0.0%
4	 055246	 Samaras Joy	 56	 [	12]	 C J’ston-Porter	 16.0%	 B Graham	 3.8%
5	 778990	 I’m Back Baby	 56	 [	 8]	 C Martinan (3)	 5.2%	 D Miller	 0.0%
6	 366	 Petite Vitesse	 56	 [	13]	 W Pike	 25.2%	 Simon Miller	 14.8%
7	 54	 Mister Raffles	 56	 [	 3]	 Ms C Azzopardi	 3.3%	 B W Owen	 9.1%
8	 5	 Spirit Runner	 56	 [	11]	 J Noske	 9.1%	 T M Wolfe	 5.2%
9	 	 Complete Love	 56	 [	 5]	 J Whiting	 6.7%	 I Weinert	 5.2%
10	 	 Superfluous	 56	 [	10]	 H Watson	 7.7%	 Simon Miller	 14.8%
11	 738	 Snipperando	 54	 [	14]	 Ms V Corver	 7.4%	 Ryan Hill	 7.8%
12	 	 Bella Violetta	 54	 [	 6]	 Ms N Faithfull	 14.0%	 M Lane	 18.4%
13	 0	 Call Time	 54	 [	 7]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 Brandon Fiore	 8.9%
14	 	 Hillside Monarch	 54	 [	 2]	 K Dhurun	 5.8%	 J Taylor	 12.2%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1300M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1300M
	 7	 Mister Raffles
	 1	 Star Prophet
	 4	 Samaras Joy
	 6	 Petite Vitesse

4	 Samaras Joy	 22% 4	 Samaras Joy	 1:17.48
6	 Petite Vitesse	 1:17.76
3	 Kamikaze Fighter	 1:19.18
1	 Star Prophet	 1:19.45
2	 Noble Reign	 1:20.83

Race Preview: Mister Raffles Capable type. Ran home respectably at Bunbury last time out. Drawn 
well. One of the major players. Star Prophet Freshened. Showing potential. Better effort at Belmont 
Park last start. Good draw. Back to provincial level. Key player. Samaras Joy On a quick back-up. 
Drawn off the track. Consider. Petite Vitesse Battled on fairly here first-up. Strips fitter. Needs luck 
from out there. Has claims. Superfluous Trials: (3:0-1-0). Look to markets.

RACE 12	 3:55 PM	 (A$25,000)	 Northam	 --   1300m
1	 386240	 Biondo	 58	 [	 3]	 T Turner	 8.8%	 D Rudland	 0.0%
2	 67422	 Repeater	 58	 [	12]	 S Parnham	 8.1%	 J Tangaroa	 10.3%
3	 87448	 Findout	 58	 [	 9]	 H Watson	 7.7%	 G Carige	 0.0%
4	 0	 Invasore	 58	 [	 7]	 J Whiting	 6.7%	 R J Piercey	 8.3%
5	 522	 Pond Master	 56	 [	10]	 W Pike	 25.2%	 T Ikenushi	 9.5%
6	 988328	 Lien Hyphen	 56	 [	13]	 Ms N Faithfull	 14.0%	 Sue Olive	 6.7%
7	 8749	 Battle On Battler	 56	 [	 6]	 J Azzopardi	 6.5%	 T M Wolfe	 5.2%
8	 	 Milly’s Clever Too	 56	 [	 5]	 J Turner	 7.0%	 C Webster	 6.3%
9	 	 Smart Energy	 56	 [	14]	 P Carbery	 7.0%	 Simon Miller	 14.8%
10	 	 The Merryman	 56	 [	16]	 J Noske	 9.1%	 Simon Miller	 14.8%
11	 733	 Mighty Hosanna	 54	 [	11]	 J Brown	 7.5%	 J Taylor	 12.2%
12	 0	 Karsavina	 54	 [	 1]	 L Campbell	 9.7%	 D & B Pearce	 15.7%
13	 	 Gingerbread Girl	 54	 [	 2]	 K Dhurun	 5.8%	 Ryan Hill	 7.8%
14	 	 Shamilian Miss	 54	 [	 8]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 M Lane	 18.4%
15	666995	 Crombie	 58	 [	15]	 --	 --%	 J D Jachmann	 8.1%
16	 09076	 Geebabe	 56	 [	 4]	 C J’ston-Porter	 16.0%	 Ms D Murphy	 0.0%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1300M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1300M
	 5	 Pond Master
	 11	Mighty Hosanna
	 14	Shamilian Miss
	 7	 Battle On Battler

2	 Repeater	 44%
11	Mighty Hosanna	 33%
6	 Lien Hyphen	 20%
15	Crombie	 4%

2	 Repeater	 44%
1	 Biondo	 33%
15	Crombie	 17%

2	 Repeater	 1:17.26
1	 Biondo	 1:18.83
3	 Findout	 1:18.91
5	 Pond Master	 1:19.28
15	Crombie	 1:19.32

Race Preview: Pond Master Promising 3yo. Kept on determinedly to fill the minors at short odds at 
Bunbury first-up. Will only be fitter. Include among the better chances. Mighty Hosanna Knocking 
on the door. Handy and boxed away without troubling winner at Belmont Park last start. Back to 
provincial level. Right in this. Shamilian Miss Trials: (2:1-0-0). Looked good at the trials. Monitor bet-
ting moves. Battle On Battler First-up. Back to provincial level. Place claims. Smart Energy Trials: 
(3:0-1-0). Watch betting.

RACE 13	 4:25 PM	 (A$30,000)	 Northam	 --   1300m
1	 802214	 Almaya	 60	 [	 3]	 L Campbell	 9.7%	 Mack Hall	 9.3%
2	 410200	 Image Of Pro	 59.5	 [	 4]	 K Sardelic (3)	 10.1%	 R J Malpass	 8.2%
3	 431850	 Only Eyes For Him	 59.5	 [	 8]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 Sue Olive	 6.7%
4	 136	 Talk To Wyn	 59.5	 [	10]	 B Gaerth (1.5)	 6.0%	 J Taylor	 12.2%
5	 326344	 One Punch	 59	 [	 5]	 S Parnham	 8.1%	 R Stewart	 7.8%
6	 445029	 Crimmo	 58.5	 [	 9]	 A Galati	 12.7%	 Dylan Bairstow	 16.4%
7	 254312	 Miss Wall Street	 58.5	 [	 2]	 C Parnham	 18.6%	 D Morton	 15.0%
8	 417	 L’Il Capri	 58	 [	 6]	 C Cooper (3)	 10.5%	 G & A Williams	 20.0%
9	 932562	 Western Impact	 56.5	 [	 1]	 S O’Donnell	 4.8%	 R J Malpass	 8.2%
10	558708	 Strictly Cash	 54	 [	 7]	 Ms C Azzopardi	 3.3%	 S J Ryan	 8.7%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1300M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1300M
★	4	 Talk To Wyn
	 7	 Miss Wall Street
	 8	 L’il Capri
	 3	 Only Eyes For Him

7	 Miss Wall Street	 50%
2	 Image Of Pro	 33%
1	 Almaya	 27%
10	Strictly Cash	 25%

2	 Image Of Pro	 100%
1	 Almaya	 44%
6	 Crimmo	 33%
5	 One Punch	 33%
4	 Talk To Wyn	 33%

6	 Crimmo	 1:17.70
1	 Almaya	 1:17.71
10	Strictly Cash	 1:18.68
7	 Miss Wall Street	 1:18.89
2	 Image Of Pro	 1:19.17

Race Preview: Talk To Wyn Freshened. Battled on fairly at Belmont Park last outing. 1.5kg claimer 
engaged. Leads/handy. Back to provincial level. One of the major players. Miss Wall Street Let down 
well from back of the pack to place at Belmont Park last time out. Drawn favourably. Back to provincial 
level. Each-way. L’Il Capri Wasn’t all that far away at Belmont Park last outing. 3kg claimer engaged. 
Back to provincial level. Worth some thought. Only Eyes For Him First-up. Wasn’t far away in Maiden 
company at Pinjarra first-up last campaign. Back to provincial level. Has claims. One Punch Form 
solid. Wasn’t all that far away at Belmont Park at latest. Back to provincial level. In the mix.

RACE 14	 5:00 PM	 (A$30,000)	 Northam	 --   1000m
1	 715378	 Divine Pair	 60.5	 [	 4]	 T Turner	 8.8%	 C Webster	 6.3%
2	 168322	 Lord Shiva	 58.5	 [	 7]	 B Gaerth (1.5)	 6.0%	 A Durrant	 13.4%
3	 876703	 Palaggio	 58.5	 [	10]	 K Sardelic (3)	 10.1%	 B Monteleone	 0.0%
4	 182479	 Wicked Venom	 58.5	 [	 2]	 J Turner	 7.0%	 R Radford	 8.6%
5	 102127	 Janny	 58	 [	 5]	 C Cooper (3)	 10.5%	 G & A Williams	 20.0%
6	 914227	 Close Talker	 57.5	 [	 1]	 H Watson	 7.7%	 Simon Miller	 14.8%
7	 676504	 On The Full	 56.5	 [	 9]	 P Carbery	 7.0%	 A Pateman	 12.1%
8	 18	 Ellicazam	 56	 [	 6]	 L Ramoly	 10.9%	 N Parnham	 9.6%
9	 666611	 Shasfa	 55	 [	 3]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 B Pope	 8.7%
10	444770	 Butterfly House	 54.5	 [	 8]	 Ms N Faithfull	 14.0%	 D S White	 0.0%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1000M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1000M
	 6	 Close Talker
	 5	 Janny
	 4	 Wicked Venom
	 2	 Lord Shiva

4	 Wicked Venom	 100%
8	 Ellicazam	 100%
7	 On The Full	 67%
2	 Lord Shiva	 67%
1	 Divine Pair	 58%

8	 Ellicazam	 100%
5	 Janny	 67%
4	 Wicked Venom	 48%
1	 Divine Pair	 48%
6	 Close Talker	 47%

5	 Janny	 0:57.03
10	Butterfly House	 0:57.21
6	 Close Talker	 0:57.35
2	 Lord Shiva	 0:57.58
1	 Divine Pair	 0:58.06

Race Preview: Close Talker Resuming. Won in Maiden company at Pinjarra Scarpside first-up 
last campaign. Drawn to receive every chance. Back to provincial level. Commands respect. Janny 
First-up. 3kg claimer engaged. Placed in Benchmark 46+ company at Narrogin first-up last campaign. 
Front-running. Back to provincial level. Can play a key role. Wicked Venom First-up. Wasn’t far away 
in Rst 0 Met Win-LY company at Bunbury first-up last campaign. Suited over this distance. Good gate. 
Back to provincial level. Major player. Lord Shiva Made the running and kept on to just miss at short 
odds this level here last outing. 1.5kg claimer engaged. Has claims. On The Full Wasn’t all that far 
away at Belmont Park at latest. Races well on this track. Needs luck from out there. Back to provincial 
level. Place claims.
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RACE 15	 5:35 PM	 (A$30,000)	 Northam	 --   1400m
1	 464547	 Megami	 60	 [	 4]	 J Noske	 9.1%	 T Ikenushi	 9.5%
2	 465008	 Henchard	 56.5	 [	 8]	 S Parnham	 8.1%	 C Maynard	 0.0%
3	 621313	 Queensland Diesel	 56.5	 [	 7]	 P Carbery	 7.0%	 A Mathews	 4.5%
4	 351956	 Costa Del Santo	 56	 [	 9]	 J Azzopardi	 6.5%	 Jordan Rolfe	 13.5%
5	 777792	 Ensign Pulver	 54	 [	 1]	 J Brown	 7.5%	 B Seinor	 4.9%
6	 894088	 He’sgotwings	 54	 [	 6]	 H Watson	 7.7%	 G J Kersley	 0.0%
7	 643176	 Kelora	 54	 [	 2]	 K Dhurun	 5.8%	 N Parnham	 9.6%
8	 304193	 Looks	 54	 [	 5]	 Ms L Fiore	 11.9%	 T M Wolfe	 5.2%
9	 838264	 Pretty Devine	 54	 [	 3]	 Ms N Faithfull	 14.0%	 Mack Hall	 9.3%
10	000078	 Saturn Black	 54	 [	10]	 B B-Edwards	 6.7%	 Ms D Murphy	 0.0%
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	 SELECTIONS 	 NORTHAM 	 1400M DISTANCE 	 BEST TIME 1400M
	 8	 Looks
	 1	 Megami
	 4	 Costa Del Santo
	 9	 Pretty Devine

4	 Costa Del Santo	 67%
1	 Megami	 50%
2	 Henchard	 50%
6	 He’sgotwings	 42%
3	 Queensland Diesel	 33%

2	 Henchard	 67%
4	 Costa Del Santo	 27%
9	 Pretty Devine	 27%
8	 Looks	 24%
1	 Megami	 22%

5	 Ensign Pulver	 1:22.59
6	 He’sgotwings	 1:23.89
4	 Costa Del Santo	 1:24.02
8	 Looks	 1:24.03
10	Saturn Black	 1:24.10

Race Preview: Looks Better effort at Bunbury at latest. On pacer. Looks one of the main chances. 
Megami Was safely held at Belmont Park first-up. Fitter. Drawn favourably. Back to provincial level. 
In the mix. Costa Del Santo Fair effort without threatening at Bunbury at latest. Each-way. Pretty 
Devine Fair effort without threatening at Toodyay at latest. Free-running. Drawn favourably. Has 
claims. Queensland Diesel Freshened. Settled handy and battled on soundly to fill the minors last 
time out. Place.


